Summary of Laboratory Services RFQ - Individual Testing Parameters

INDIVIDUAL TEST PARAMETER 2026 & 2027 2028 I 2029 (2030 opt)
ANALYTE EACH EACH EACH EACH
[Acetone 45.00 46.35 $47.74 $49.17
Alkalinity (total) 16.00 16.4: 15.97 $17.48
Aluminum {total recoverable ) 15.00 15.45 15.91 $16.39
Ammonia - N $25.00 25.75 26.52 $27.32
Antimony {total recoverable | 'EIS.OO $15.45 15.91 16.39
Arsenic (dissolved) $15.00 $15.45 $15.91 16.39
Arsenic (total recoverable | $15.00 $15.45 $15.91 16.39
Barium ( dissolved) $15.00 $15.45 15.91 $16.39
Barium (total recoveratﬁ_J 1815.00 5.45 15.9 16.39
Beryliium (total recoverable) $15.00 15.45 13.9 16.39
Biochemical Oxygen Demand (BOD,) Ez.oo 32.96 33.95 34.97
BTEX $46.00 $47.38 48.80 50.27
BTU No Bid No Bid [No Bid No Bid
Cadmium (dissolved) $15.00 $15.45 $15.91 16.39
Cadmijum {total recoverable} 15.00 —|815.45 _._S 5.91 16.39
Calcium | dissolved) $15.00 5.45 591 $16.39
Calcium (total recoverable ) $15.00 5.45 15.91 16.39
Carbonaceous Biochemical Oxyeen Demand (CBOD1$32.00 $32.96 33395 34.97
CCFP $35.00 $36.05 $37.13 38.25
g@cal Oxvgen Demand {COD | $22.00 22.66 $23.34 24.04
Chloride $16.00 $16.48 $16.97 17.48
[Chiorine (total | No Bid - Field TesiNo Bid Field Test|No Bid Field Tes:|No Bid Field Test
Chromium (dissolved) $15.00 15.45 $15.91 $16.39
Chromium (total recoverable | $15.00 15.45 $15.91 $16.39
Cobalt itotal recoverable) $15.00 $15.45 [$15.91 6.39
Copiper (total recoverable 15.00 $15.45 $15.91 6.39
Cvanide {Reactive) 50.00 $51.50 $53.05 54.64
Cvanide (total) 38.00 $39.14 4031 $41.52
Dissolved Oxvizen 15.00 $15.45 1591 1639

Coli 525.00 2375 526,52 $27.32
Clectroconductiviny B.00 e 37 53 HO.83
[ lucride 15.00 1545 541 16.39
Fomaldebvde 150400 54 50 50,14 f3.41
Hardness (as CaCO5) 13,00 545 1391 %16.39
Herbicides 160100 164 80 $169.74 $174.84
Hexavalent Cr S0, 59270 i T COR 35
Hydrogen sulfide Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lron {total) $15.00 15.45 3159 $16.39
Lead {dissolved) $15.00 1545 $15.¢ 16.39
Lead {1ital recoverable) 15.00 15.45 $15.9 16,39
Marngnnese itotalj 1500 15.45 159 16.34
Mercury (dissulved) 22.0¢ 22.66 23.34 $524.04
Mercury (104l recoverable) Cold Varor Method 22.00 22.66 $23.34 $24.04
Methvl ethv! ketone $45.00 $46.35 $47.74 49.17
lMol\'bdem;m (total recoverable "15.00 5.45 $15.91 16.39
Nickel {total rccoverable) 15.00 5.45 $15.91 1639
Nitrate as N (OR NO,) 16.00 'g, 6.48 1816.97 17.48
Nitrite as N (OR NOy) 16.00 $16.48 16.97 17.48
NOx (NO,+ NO3) $16.00 16.48 16.97 17.48
QA2 - Gasoline / Diesel ranzes $48.00 49.44 50.92 52.45
il & Grease 75.00 77.25 79.57 $81.95
ortho - Phosphorus itotal ) 15.00 19.57 20.16 $20.76
Paint Filter Test 15.00 15.45 15.91 $16.39
PCB-1254, 1016, 1232, 1248, 1242, 1221, 1260 60.00 $61.80 $63.65 565.56
Pesticides ~ orzanochiorine 98.00 $100.94 $103.97 $107.09
Pesticides - orzanophoshorus 140.00 $144.20 $148.53 152.98
oH {liguid) 12.00 12.36 $12.73 13.11
H (Solids} $12.00 12.36 12.73 13.11
Phenolic compounds $26.00 26.78 27.5 28.41
Phosphorus {total recoverable | $22.00 22.66 23.34 24.04
$15.00 $15.45 15.9] 16.39
Potassium {total recoverable $15.00 $15.45 315.91 16.39
No Bid No Bid No Bid [No Bid
15.00 15.45 15.91 $16.39
Selenium itotal recoverable | 15.00 15.45 15.91 $16.39
15.00 15.45 15.91 $16.39
Silver {total recoverable) 5.00 $15.45 15.91 $16.39
Sodium (dissolved) 5.00 $15.45 15.91 16.39
Sodium (total recoverable] 5.00 $15.45 15.91 16.39
16.00 16.48 16.97 17.48
45.00 46.35 47.74 $49.17
Sulide (Reactive) $50.00 51.50 53.05 $54.64
Surfactants IMBAS | $55.00 58.00 60.00 $62.00
TCLP Metal A (total} $46.00 47.38 48.80 50.27
TCLP Metal As ltotal) $46.00 4738 48.80 50.27
TCLP Metal Ba (totall 46.00 $47.3 $48.80 50.27
TCLP Metal Cd {total) 46.00 47.3 543 80 50.27
TCLP Metal Cr itotal) 46.00 47.3. $48.80 50.27
TCLP Metal He itotal) 22.00 22.66 23.34 24.04
TCLP Metal Ph itotal 46.00 47.38 48.80 50.27
TCLP Metal Se itotal | 46.00 47.38 48.80 50.27
Temperature No Bid - Field Tes{No Bid Field Test|No Bid Field Test[Nc Bid Field Test
' Thallium (total recoverable| 15.00 $15.45 $1591 $16.39
Tin (total recoverable) 15.00 $15.45 $13.01 16.39
| Total Dissolved Solids | TDS | 17.00 17.51 18.04 18.58
Total Hardness (as CaCO3) 15.00 15.45 1591 $16.39
Total Kjeldahl Nitrogzen | TKN) 25.00 25.75 26.52 $27.32
Total Moisture (%) 3.00 3.09 $3.18 $3.28




Summary of Laboratory Services RFQ - Individual Testing Parameters

INDIVIDUAL TEST PARAMETER 2026 & 2027 2028 2029 (2030 opt) |
ANALYTE EACH EACH EACH EACH
Total Nitrogen (TN calculated) 10.00 $10.30 10.61 10.93
Total Petroleum Hy drocarbons ( TPH 48.00 $49.44 50.92 52.45
Total Solids (%) $12.00 $12.36 $12.73 3.11
Total Suspended Solids (TSS) $17.00 $17.51 $18.04 .58
Total Toxic Orzanics 40 CFR 413.02(i $367.00 378.01 $389.35 401.03
Toxicily . Ceriodt_lelmiﬂ 1IC25) $1.030.00 $1.070.00 $1.100.00 $1.140.00
Toxiciry. Ceriodaphnia (1 C50) 0* $ 3 $
Toxiciiy, Pimephales (IC25) $1.030.00 $1.060.90 $1.092.73 $1,125.51
Toxicity . LPimephales (1.C50) 0* B 0* 0¥
Turbidirs $16.00 16.48 $16.97 $17.48
Volatile Organics {See attached list) $69.00 71.07 $73.20 $75.40
Zinc(total recoverable) $15.00 $15.45 $15.9] $16.39

™ We can obtain both the LC50 and IC25 data from a single test. The cited fee includes return freight via FedEx Priority

Overnig ht (10:30a)

** TKN and NO3+NO2 are required for Total N and are riced in the table above,



